

EASTERN KENTUCKY UNIVERSITY

Commodity: Demolition of Todd and Dupree Hall

EKU 16-18

Opened: 06/09/17, 10:00 AM (EST)

	Renasant Inc., Indianapolis, IN	Grant's Excavating, Richmond, KY	North American Dismantling Corp., Lebanon, OH	DH Griffin Wrecking Co., Greensboro, NC	O'Rourke Wrecking Co., Cincinnati, OH	American Demolition Corp., Elgin, IL		
Bid Price - Mechanical Demolition	\$ 826,000.00		\$ 1,640,000.00	\$ 994,777.00	\$ 1,567,000.00	\$ 2,586,500.00		
Add Alt - Diversion of 95% Of Debris	\$ 2,000.00		No Bid	\$ 95,000.00	No Bid	\$ 63,500.00		
Unit Price - 200 cu.yd. of Crushed Concrete	\$ 1,100.00		No Bid	12.00/tn	No Bid	No Bid		
Number of Days to Complete	100		120	117	120	165		
Points Earned - Price (90 pts possible)	90		45.33	74.73	47.44	28.74		
Points Earned - Schedule (10 pts possible)	7.5		6.25	6.41	6.25	4.55		
Bid Price - Incl. Explosives		\$ 932,000.00	\$ 2,100,000.00		\$ 1,777,000.00			
Number of Days to Complete		75	120		120			
Points Earned - Price (90 pts possible)		79.76						
Points Earned - Schedule (10 pts possible)		10						
TOTAL SCORE	97.50	89.76	51.58	81.14	53.69	33.29		

This is to certify that the attached is a true and exact copy of the tabulation of bids/proposals received for the above referenced project, that same was advertised and opened in the manner prescribed by the Commonwealth.

Signature of Purchasing Official: _____

Date: 6/9/17